
Court No. - 21

Case :- MATTERS UNDER ARTICLE 227 No. - 1194 of 2023

Petitioner :- Smt. Shakuntala
Respondent :- Learned Court Of Board Of Revenue, Lko. And 
Another
Counsel for Petitioner :- Rohit Kumar Singh,Anil Kumar 
Tiwari
Counsel for Respondent :- C.S.C.

Hon'ble Manish Mathur,J.

Heard learned Counsel for petitioner and learned State Counsel
for opposite party no. 1. 

In view of the order being proposed to be passed, issuance of
notice to opposite party no. 2 stands dispensed with.

Petition under Article 227 of the Constitution of India has been
filed seeking a direction to the court concerned for expeditious
disposal  of  revision  filed  by  the  opposite  party  no.  2  under
Section 219 of Land Revenue Act, 1901. 

Learned counsel for petitioner submits that the petitioner is the
respondent  in  the  aforesaid  revisional  proceedings  and  has
already  filed  objections,  as  such,  directions  are  required  for
expeditious disposal of the revision.

Considering submissions advanced by learned Counsel for the
petitioner, the opposite party no. 1 i.e., Learned Court of Board
of Revenue, U.P., Lucknow, is directed to decide the revision
filed by opposite party party no. 2 registered as Revision No.
155 of 2022 District- Ayodhya, (Smt. Shanti Devi versus Smt.
Shakuntala and others) expeditiously, preferably within a period
of six months from the date, a certified copy of this order is
brought on record of proceedings, in case there is no other legal
impediment. 

Benefit of this order shall be available only in case petitioner
cooperates in early conclusion of the application/trial.

With the aforesaid direction, the petition stands disposed of.

Order Date :- 3.3.2023
Mohd. Sharif
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